
Level Sport Type Description of Violation Action Date

Level III MFB
Impermissible Publicity (NCAA Bylaw 

13.10.1)
A football staff member publicized a 
prospect's visit on Instagram.

Staff member was prohibited from 
recruiting activities for a period of 2 
weeks. Rules education for the entire 
football staff. 

6/24/2022

Level III MFB
Impermissible Transportation and 

Recruiting Inducements (NCAA 
Bylaws 13.5 & 13.2.1)

Football prospective student-athlete 
was provided transportation and a 
change of clothes on an unofficial visit 
after missing his flight home.

Student-athlete donated the 
impermissible amount in milage and 
clothing cost to a charity of his choice. 
The Assistant Coach was prohibited 
from recruiting for two weeks. Rules 
education was provided to the staff. 

6/25/2022

Level III MFB
Impermissible Sports Wagering 

(NCAA Bylaw 10.3)

A former football student worker 
engaged in impermissible sports 
wagering in professional sports.

Rules education for the sport staff. 12/16/2023

Level III WGY 
Exceeding Student-Athlete Time 

Limits (NCAA Bylaw 17.1.7.1)

The team exceeded the daily limit for 
countable activities on one occasion for 
a total of one hour.

The program reduced countable 
activities by two hours. Rules 
education was provided to the staff 
and student-athletes.

3/11/2024

Level III WEQ
Impermissible Recruiting 

Correspondence (NCAA Bylaw 13.4)

A coach sent a text message to a 
prospective student-athlete prior to the 
first permissible date.

Staff will not be able to have 
written/electronic communication with 
the prospective student-athlete for 
two weeks once it is permissible.  

6/15/2024

Level III WGY 
Impermissible Publicity (NCAA Bylaw 

13.10.1.2)

A  Women's Gymnastics Coach 
publicized three prospects' visits on 
Instagram.

Staff member was prohibited from 
contacting the three prospective 
student-athletes for 14 days. All other 
gymnastics staff members were 
prohibited from contacting the student-
athletes for 7 days.

9/7/2024
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Level III MBA
Impermissible Camp Advertisement 
(NCAA Bylaw 12.5.1.6 & 13.12.1.3)

A camp advertisement included 
pictures of current student-athletes 
and did not include the required 
attendance restrictions.

Rules education was provided to the 
sport staff and department staff.

11/13/2024

Level III WGO
Impermissible Contact (NCAA Bylaw 

13.1.2.1)

A prospect had impermissible contact 
with a non-staff member during a visit 
to campus. 

Rules education was provided to the 
coaching staff and the impermissible 
activity was counted as a contact with 
the prospect.

11/16/2024

Level III WGY 
Impermissible Complimentary 

Admissions (NCAA Bylaw 13.7.3.1)

A prospect received more than three 
complimentary tickets on an unofficial 
visit.

Rules education for the sport staff. 
Institution requested repayment for 
the value of the additional tickets.

2/14/2025


